

PROPOSAL TABULATION #1-2020 HERBICIDE SPRAY CHEMICALS RECEIVED 01-31-20					SUPPLIER			SUPPLIER			SUPPLIER		
Proposal #01-2020 Williams County Engineer Drainage and Highway Departments 2020 SPRAY CHEMICALS Williams County, Ohio		Williams County Engineer's Office 12953 County Road G Bryan, Ohio 43506 419-636-2454 x 23 Fax 419-636-8687 Todd J. Roth, P.E., P.S. email: troth@wmscoengineer.com			Arborchem Products Mechanicsburg, PA			Helena Agri-Enterprises Columbus, Ohio			Red River Specialties Shreveport, Louisiana		
Supply Products Listed Below in Manufacture's Standard Containers					Standard Containers			Standard Containers			Standard Containers		
Bid Item	Name	Unit	Quantity	Estimated Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size
1	Nufarm Aquanet (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$17.24	2.5 G	G	\$17.95	2.5 G	G	\$18.50	2.5, 5, 30, 265 G
2	BASF Arsenal (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$56.47	2.5 G	G	\$72.00	2.5 G	G	\$53.80	2.5, 5, 30, 265 G
3	Red River - 90 (or equivalent surfactant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$13.50	2.5 G	G	\$11.50	2.5 G	G	\$10.48	2.5, 5, 30, 265 G
4	Dow AgroSciences DMA - 4	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$13.50	2.5 G	G	\$11.96	2.5 G	G	\$12.00	2.5, 5, 30, 265 G
5	Red River Drift 1% (or equivalent adjuvant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$134.40	12x1 QT Cs	G	\$45.00	2.5 G	G	\$8.40	2.5 G
6	Nufarm Triplet SF	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$26.75	2.5 G	G	\$26.00	2.5 G	G	\$29.00	2.5 G
7	Banvel	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$74.00	2.5 G	G	\$39.95	2.5 G, 30 G
8	Dow AgroSciences Pathway	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$37.00	2.5 G	G	\$37.00	2.5 G	G	\$34.50	2.5 G
9	Red River Elite Secure Ultra (or equivalent adjuvant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	10.95/29.95	1 QT, 1 G
10	Dow AgroSciences Garlon 3A (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$51.26	2.5 G	G	\$48.40	2.5 G	G	\$39.67	2.5 G, 30 G
11	Dupont Escort (or equivalent)	oz.	1.0	No Estimate	Oz	\$2.91	16 Oz	Oz	\$2.90	16 Oz	Oz	\$2.90	16 OZ, 64 OZ
12	Dow AgroSciences Pathfinder II	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$44.27	2.5 G	G	\$48.00	2.5 G	G	\$41.25	2.5 G
13	DowAgroSciences Capstone (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$39.99	2.5 G	G	\$48.00	2.5 G	G	\$48.00	2.5 G, 265 G
14	Defoamer	Case	1.0	No Estimate	Cs	\$115.80	12x1 QT Cs	Cs	\$90.00	12X1 PT Cs	Cs	8.50/24.00	12X1 QT Cs, 4 X 1 G Cs
15	Water Conditioner	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$12.75	2.5 G	G	\$15.50	2.5 G	G	\$13.50	2.5 G, 265 G
16	Bayor Esplande 200	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$1,189.12	2.5 G	G	\$1,169.92	2.5 G	G	\$1,189.12	1 QT, 2.5 G, 5 G
					QT	\$327.04	4x1 QT					\$327.04	
17	Bayor Method 240	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$322.56	2.5 G	G	\$318.72	2.5 G	G	\$322.56	2.5, 5, 265 G
					QT	\$91.52	4x1 QT						
18	Dow AgroSciences Cleantraxx (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$135.25	2.5 G	G	\$128.00	2.5 G	G	\$128.00	2.5 G
19	Dow AgroSciences Crossbox (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$48.00	2.5 G	G	\$43.80	2.5 G
Highlighted Block Indicates an Or Equal or Generic Product													
Provide Products Listed Below in Supplier's Bulk Containers					Bulk Containers			Bulk Containers			Bulk Containers		
Bid Item	Name	Unit	Quantity	Estimated Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size	Unit	Unit Price	Container Size
20	Nufarm Aquanet (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$17.75	30 G	G	\$18.50	265 G Tote
21	BASF Arsenal (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$54.27	30 G	G	\$72.00	2.5 G	G	\$53.80	266 G Tote
22	Red River - 90 (or equivalent surfactant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$11.50	30 G	G	\$10.48	267 G Tote
23	Dow AgroSciences DMA - 4	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$12.90	30 G	G	\$11.96	2.5 G	G	\$12.00	268 G Tote
24	Red River Drift 1% (or equivalent adjuvant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$45.00	2.5 G	G	\$8.40	2.5 G
25	Nufarm Triplet SF	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$26.00	2.5 G	G	\$29.00	2.5 G
26	Banvel	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$74.00	2.5 G	G	\$39.95	30 G
27	Dow AgroSciences Pathway	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$37.00	2.5 G	G	\$34.50	2.5 G
28	Red River Elite Secure Ultra (or equivalent adjuvant)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$29.95	1 G
29	Dow AgroSciences Garlon 3A (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$46.20	30 G	G	\$51.40	250 G Tote	G	\$39.67	30 G
30	Dupont Escort (or equivalent)	oz.	1.0	No Estimate	Oz	NO BID	NO BID	Oz	\$2.90	16 OZ	Oz	\$2.90	64 OZ
31	Dow AgroSciences Pathfinder II	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$48.00	2.5 G	G	\$41.25	2.5 G
32	DowAgroSciences Capstone (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	\$39.50	30 G	G	\$51.00	250 G Tote	G	\$48.00	265 G Tote
33	Defoamer	Case	1.0	No Estimate	Cs	NO BID	NO BID	Cs	\$144.00	4 x 1G Cs	Cs	\$24.00	1 G
34	Water Conditioner	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$14.50	30 G	G	\$13.50	265 G Tote
35	Bayor Esplande 200	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$1,169.92	2.5 G	G	327.04/1,189.12	5 G Cube
36	Bayor Method 240	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$318.72	2.5 G	G	\$322.56	265 G Tote
37	Dow AgroSciences Cleantraxx (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$128.00	2.5 G	G	\$128.00	2.5 G
38	Dow AgroSciences Crossbox (or equivalent)	Gallon	1.0	No Estimate	G	NO BID	NO BID	G	\$48.00	2.5 G	G	\$43.80	2.5 G
Highlighted Block Indicates an Or Equal or Generic Product													
	UNSOLICITED ALTERNATE - BAYER VIEWPOINT	Pound	1.0	No Estimate	LB	\$69.12	8x51 Pound Dry Mix	OR EQUAL SUBMITTALS			OR EQUAL SUBMITTALS		
								1	Roundup Custom		1	Roundup Custom	
								3	Inlet				
								4	Weedar 64		4	Weedar 64	
								5	Justified				
								7	Vision		7	Diablo	
								15	Request		10	Element 3A	