

BID TABULATION KUNKLE WASTEWATER - DIVISION B: WASTEWATER LAGOONS						BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER	
WILLIAMS COUNTY COMMISSIONERS KUNKLE WASTEWATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS DIVISION B: WASTEWATER LAGOONS Williams County, Ohio Date: 10-5-20 Revised: 11-2-20 Prepared By: Clum Revised By: Clum		WILLIAMS COUNTY ENGINEERS OFFICE 12953 County Road G Bryan, Ohio 43506 (419) - 636 - 2454 (voice) (419) - 636 - 8687 (fax) Bid Date: November 2, 2020 (Add 1) Project #8-2020				BRYAN EXCAVATING, LLC. BRYAN, OHIO		HELMS AND SONS EXCAVATING, INC. FINDLAY, OHIO		UNDERGROUND UTILITIES, INC. MONROEVILLE, OHIO		VERNON NAGEL INCORPORATED NAPOLEON, OHIO	
Item	Description	Unit	Quantity	Unit Price	Cost								
ITEM 001: WASTEWATER LAGOON													
1	General Work - Wastewater Lagoon Improvements	Lump	1.0	\$1,260,759.00	\$1,260,759.00	\$1,096,600.00	\$1,096,600.00	\$1,231,576.50	\$1,231,576.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$894,000.00	\$894,000.00
2	Access Road	L.F.	125.0	\$100.00	\$12,500.00	\$30.00	\$3,750.00	\$83.59	\$10,448.75	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$75.00	\$9,375.00
ITEM 002: CONTINGENCY ITEMS													
3	Excavation of Unsuitable Material	C.Y.	100.0	\$20.00	\$2,000.00	\$4.50	\$450.00	\$38.00	\$3,800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$1,000.00
4a	Furnishing and Installing Fill Material - Excavated Material	C.Y.	100.0	\$25.00	\$2,500.00	\$9.00	\$900.00	\$45.00	\$4,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$8.00	\$800.00
4b	Furnishing and Installing Fill Material - Class B Concrete	C.Y.	100.0	\$300.00	\$30,000.00	\$160.00	\$16,000.00	\$132.00	\$13,200.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$81.00	\$8,100.00
ITEM 003: ALLOWANCE ITEMS													
5	General Contingency Allowance - as per section 01021	Lump	1.0	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00
TOTAL ESTIMATE WITH CONTINGENCIES BASE BID			\$1,327,759.00		TOTAL BASE BID	\$1,137,700.00		\$1,283,525.25		NO BID		\$933,275.00	
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE ITEMS													
A1	Additive Alternate 1: Lagoon 3 - As Per Plan.	Lump	1.0	\$262,178.00	\$262,178.00	\$144,700.00	\$144,700.00	\$198,805.55	\$198,805.55		\$0.00	\$199,500.00	\$199,500.00
TOTAL ESTIMATE WITH CONTINGENCIES & ALTERNATE 1			\$1,589,937.00		TOTAL BASE BID WITH ALTERNATE 1	\$1,282,400.00		\$1,482,330.80		NO BID		\$1,132,775.00	

BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER		BIDDER	
ANDERZACK-PITZEN CONSTRUCTION, INC. METAMORA, OHIO		MILLER BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION, INC. ARCHBOLD, OHIO		VTF EXCAVATION LLC CELINA, OHIO		MARK'S EXCAVATING & TRUCKING NORWALK, OHIO		BRUNS BUILDING AND DEVELOPMENT ST. HENRY, OHIO		B. HILLS EXCAVATING WAYNE, OHIO		SALENBIEN TRUCKING & EXCAVATING DUNDEE, MICHIGAN	
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,032,466.14	\$1,032,466.14	\$1,152,876.00	\$1,152,876.00	\$1,094,069.37	\$1,094,069.37	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,264,231.00	\$1,264,231.00	\$1,576,560.00	\$1,576,560.00
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$51.50	\$6,437.50	\$51.95	\$6,493.75	\$60.00	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$2,500.00	\$53.00	\$6,625.00
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6.55	\$655.00	\$4.19	\$419.00	\$5.00	\$500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$10.00	\$1,000.00
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6.55	\$655.00	\$15.92	\$1,592.00	\$25.00	\$2,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$30.00	\$3,000.00
\$0.00	\$0.00	\$158.00	\$15,800.00	\$148.50	\$14,850.00	\$130.00	\$13,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$19,800.00	\$300.00	\$30,000.00
\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00
NO BID		\$1,076,013.64		\$1,196,230.75		\$1,137,569.37		\$20,000.00		\$1,307,731.00		\$1,637,185.00	
	\$0.00	\$134,988.33	\$134,988.33	\$168,000.00	\$168,000.00	\$1,500,000.00	\$1,500,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109,100.00	\$109,100.00	\$260,773.00	\$260,773.00
NO BID		\$1,211,001.97		\$1,364,230.75		\$2,637,569.37		NO BID		\$1,416,831.00		\$1,897,958.00	